
2012 International Building Code Update ATTACHMENT 1
RECOMMENDED SIGNIFICANT CHANGES

Page 1 of 3

CODE SECTION DESCRIPTION
PUBLIC COMMENTS/DISCUSSION & {STAFF 
RESPONSE}

STAFF RECOMMENDATION* BRB RECOMMENDATION
CITY COUNCIL 
RECOMMENDATION

1 IPMC 106.4
Recommend setting minimum fine for violating the IPMC at $100.  The 
maximum fine of $500 would remain the same.

How does $35 grass ticket vs. $100 fine work?  
{Violators will pay both the cost of the city to mow 
and the fine.}

AMEND:  Set minimum fine at 
$100. Approve (7-0)

2 IPMC 111
This section outlines the appeal process from a decision made by a code 
officer pursuant to the IPMC.  Recommend deleting this section.

How does this relate to small court fines/possible 
class-action issue? {Small court serves as due process 
and means of appeal.}

AMEND:  Delete appeal 
process to default to court 
process. Approve (7-0)

3 IPMC 302.4

This section on weeds and tall grass is replaced by section 4-3-2 of the 
Naperville municipal code.  Recommend amending municipal code 
section 4-3-2:1.3 to require grass in parkways not to exceed 8" in height 
to be consistent with the height allowed in private yards.  Currently, 
parkway grass cannot exceed 5" in height.

AMEND:  Grass < 8" in 
parkway and private yard. Approve (7-0)

4 IPMC 304.1
This section adds a long list of specific code violations on the exterior of 
the property. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

5 IPMC 305.1.1
This section adds a long list of specific code violations on the interior of 
the property. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

6 IPMC 306.1.1
This section adds a long list of specific code violations relating to 
component serviceability. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

7 IMC 504.6    M1502 Domestic clothes dryer ducts
Positive change, consistent with manufacturers 
recommendations.  {Noted.} ADOPT Approve (7-0)

8 IMC
505.2                   
M 1504.1 Domestic kitchen exhaust make-up air

What is market availability of products?  Any thought 
about overall s.f. of home trigger.  1200 cfm exhaust 
would have a greater impact on a 2500 sf home vs. a 
5000 s.f. home.  This requirement should be 
eliminated for larger homes.  {Currently available for 
commercial applications.  Some builders already 
applied in field.  Not recommended to eliminate for 
larger homes since make-up air is necessary to 
optimize the function of the home.} ADOPT Approve (7-0)

9 IMC Table 403.3 Min. ventilation rates for nail stations ADOPT Approve (7-0)

10 IFGC
Chapter 9      
Section 614.6

Dryer Vents: Change from 25' to 35' duct run. Nail Guards required if 
duct is less than 1 1/4" from edge. 4" nominal smooth duct. Label length 
of exhaust duct ADOPT Approve (7-0)

11 IFGC
Chapter 12     
Section 202

Definitions: 3rd party certification on pipe and tubing. Each section of 
pipe and each fitting utilized in a gas system requires the identification 
of the manufacturer. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

12 IPC 403.2.1 Family restrooms ADOPT Approve (7-0)

13 IPC 607.2 Maximum distance for hot water branch piping
How will this be applied to remodels/upgrades?  
{Only applies to new construction.}

AMEND:  Coordinate with 
IECC. Approve (7-0)

14 IPC 712.3.5 Point of connection restriction for ejector discharge ADOPT Approve (7-0)

15 IPC 715.1 Building Sewer Backwater Valve Installation AMEND:  Not require valve. Approve (7-0)

16 IPC 802.3 Prohibition of waste receptors in crawl spaces and attics AMEND:  Delete section. Approve (7-0)



2012 International Building Code Update ATTACHMENT 1
RECOMMENDED SIGNIFICANT CHANGES

Page 2 of 3

CODE SECTION DESCRIPTION
PUBLIC COMMENTS/DISCUSSION & {STAFF 
RESPONSE}

STAFF RECOMMENDATION* BRB RECOMMENDATION
CITY COUNCIL 
RECOMMENDATION

17 IPC/(IRC) IRC Appendix F
Installation of Passive Radon Abatement System for New Residential 
Construction

AMEND:  Reference IRC 
Appendix F requiring passive 
radon system.  (Note - 
recently adopted as a state 
mandate.) Approve (7-0)

18 NEC 210.12(A)

Arc-Fault protection for dwelling units AFCI breakers will need to be 
installed in additional rooms, namely: Family Room, Dining Room, Living 
Room, Parlors, Libraries, Dens, Sunrooms, Recreation Rooms, Closets, 
Hallways and Bedrooms(only rooms currently req'd to have this).

Does staff recommend this change?  If we adopt 
code as-is, what about Romex?  Why don't we just 
use IRC/Elec instead of NEC?  {Recommend for safety 
due to number of electrical devices plugged 
throughout homes. Conduit provides for increased 
safety and flexibility for re-wiring.  IRC Electric 
supplements NEC, but does not cover all standards 
and details.} ADOPT Approve (5-2)

19 NEC 406.12

Tamper resistant receptacles are required in all 210.52 areas specified 
(but all dedicated simplex appliance receptacles in the dedicated 
appliance space) ADOPT Approve (7-0)

20 IBC

310.4 
Residential R-2.      
419.1 Live/work 
Unit          (2009, 
revised 2012)

Residential Group R-2 ADDED: Live/work unit - Dwelling unit or sleeping 
unit in which a significant portion of the space includes a nonresidential 
use that is operated by the tenant. If less than 10 percent of the area - 
may be classified as dwelling units with accessory occupancies (not 
intended for those live/work units regulated by the IRC). 

AMEND:  Coordinate with 
Zoning Code; if project 
exceeds home occupation 
requirements, live/work 
regulations apply. Approve (7-0)

21 IBC
902.1 (2009 
code change)

FIRE AREA MODIFIED: The definition of fire area to include any 
unenclosed floor area that has a roof or floor above. 

What about eaves and overhangs?  Enclosed attics?  
Does it add to bldg s.f.? {Eaves and overhangs are 
included in fire area, however sprinkler requirements 
have not changed as they relate to storage beneath 
overhead projections from buildings} ADOPT Approve (7-0)

22 IBC

903.2.4, 
903.2.7, 903.2.9 
(2009, revised 
2012)

Upholstered furniture or mattresses for sales, display, manufacturing 
and/or storage ADDED: Reduced fire area requirements for sprinkler 
protection. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

23 IBC
1016.2 
(DELETED)

Elimination of the increased travel distance allowance is the result of a 
lack of comprehensive understanding of the interaction between 
sprinklers and roof vents. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

24 IBC
1024 (2009 
code change)

Luminous Egress Path Markings ADDED: Markings delineating the exit 
path shall be provided in high-rise buildings of Group A, B, E, I, M, and R-
1 occupancies. Including steps, landings, handrails, obstacles, door 
hardware, etc. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

25 IBC
1507.16 (2009, 
revised 12)

Roof gardens and landscaped roofs ADDED: Provides reference to the 
new IFC provisions. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

26 IBC
2902.2.1 (2012 
change)

Family use toilet serving as separate facilities ADDED: Where separate 
toilet facility for each sex and each toilet is required to have only one 
water closet - two family/assisted-use toilet facilities shall be permitted. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

27 IFC 510.1 (2012)

New - All new buildings shall have approved radio coverage for 
emergency responders within the building based upon the existing 
coverage levels of the public safety communication systems of the 
jurisdiction at the exterior of the building. ADOPT Approve (7-0)



2012 International Building Code Update ATTACHMENT 1
RECOMMENDED SIGNIFICANT CHANGES

Page 3 of 3

CODE SECTION DESCRIPTION
PUBLIC COMMENTS/DISCUSSION & {STAFF 
RESPONSE}

STAFF RECOMMENDATION* BRB RECOMMENDATION
CITY COUNCIL 
RECOMMENDATION

28 IRC Table R602.3(1) Common nails not allowed to attach drywall ADOPT Approve (7-0)

29 IRC
R602.3 & Table 
602.3(3) Eliminates 6d nails to secure sheathing  8d required ADOPT Approve (7-0)

30 IRC Table 602.3(5) Habitable attic defined as an enclosed space between top story & roof. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

31 IRC R602.6.1 Prescriptive specifications to repair top plates when cut more than 50% ADOPT Approve (7-0)
32 IRC R602.1 Total revision of this code section for wall bracing ADOPT Approve (7-0)
33 IRC R602.10.1.1 Braced wall line increased to 60' ADOPT Approve (7-0)
34 IRC R602.11.1.4 Angle walls are now addressed ADOPT Approve (7-0)

35 IRC R602.10.2.2

Decreased spacing of braced wall panel from edge of braced wall line to 
10' from 12.5'. Also reduces spacing of braced wall panels to 20' from 
25'. ADOPT Approve (7-0)

36 IRC R602.10.3 New table to determine braced wall lengths ADOPT Approve (7-0)

37 IRC R602.12 New simplified method for wall bracing ADOPT Approve (7-0)

38 IRC R313 Fire suppression systems in new residential homes

Do not require sprinklers in single-family detached 
homes and duplexes. {Discussed at City Council in 
April 2012.}

AMEND:  Not require 
sprinklers in single-family 
detached homes and 
duplexes.  Approve (7-0)

39 IRC R314 Smoke alarms - can be interconnected wirelessly ADOPT Approve (7-0)

40 IEBC International Existing Building Code
Include Historic Significance for eligible properties.  
{Appropriate with corresponding studies.}

ADOPT and AMEND to include 
properties of "historic 
significance". Approve (7-0)

41 ISPSC 305 Exceptions to barrier requirements

AMEND:  Delete exceptions to 
barrier requirements (require 
fence with pool covers). Approve (7-0)

42 ISPSC 321.2 Requirements for lighting in permanent in ground pools
AMEND:  Coordinate with 
Zoning Code. Approve (7-0)

* For the column identified “Staff Recommendation”, items identified as ADOPT indicates that the code section would be adopted as published, where items identified as AMEND indicate that the code section would be adopted with amendments to the 
Naperville Municipal Code.


	ATT 1

